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COMPANY ANNOUNCEMENT 
 
The following is a Company Announcement issued by GlobalCapital plc (“the Company”) pursuant to 
the Listing Rules issued by the Listing Authority. 
 

 

Quote 

 

The Board makes reference to its previous announcement dated 8 June 2020, through which the 
market was informed of the Company’s plan to hold the Annual General Meeting (“AGM”) on 
Thursday, 30 July 2020.   

 

AGM DATE 

 

Further to the publication of Legal Notice 288 of 2020 –  Companies Act (Public Companies – Annual 
General Meetings Regulations), 2020 – published Friday 10 July 2020, the periods allowed for laying 
before and approval of the Company’s accounts and for the holding of annual general meetings were 
each extended by five (5) months. The Company wishes to avail itself of the extensions contemplated 
by virtue of the aforementioned regulations. 

Consequently, the Company wishes to inform its shareholders that it now plans to hold its AGM on 
Friday, 28 August 2020. Further information related to the AGM, will be announced at a later date.  

 

ITEMS ON THE AGENDA 

 

The Company had not previously received any items for inclusion on the agenda of the AGM by 
shareholders holding not less than 5% nominal value of the voting issued share capital of the Company 
within the period prescribed in its announcement of the 8 June 2020. Given that the AGM is now being 
held on the 28 August 2020, the Company wishes to extend the period by when shareholders holding 
not less than 5% nominal value of the voting issued share capital of the Company may: 

a. Request the Company to include items on the agenda of the AGM, provided that each item 
is accompanied by a justification or a draft resolution to be adopted at the AGM; and 

b. Table draft resolutions for items included in the agenda of the AGM.  

The period is extended until 17 July 2020 at 1700hrs. Such requests to put items on the agenda of the 
AGM or the draft resolutions referred to hereabove shall be submitted to the Company in hard copy 
(at the registered office of the Company – addressed to the Company Secretary) or in electronic form 
(companysecretary@globalcapital.com.mt).  
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RECORD DATE & NOMINATION OF DIRECTORS 

 

The Record Date for the purposes of the AGM is the 29 July 2020. This would be the Record Date on 
which all Members then on the Register of Members shall be entitled to receive notice of, participate 
in and vote at the AGM, and appoint directors or vote in the election of directors pursuant to the 
Articles of Association of the Company.  

The Company shall accept nominations in writing of candidates for the election of directors until 
1700hrs of Thursday 13 August 2020. All such nominations shall on pain of nullity be submitted on the 
prescribed form which may be collected from the Company’s registered office at GlobalCapital plc, 
Testaferrata Street, Ta` Xbiex XB1403, Malta.  

 

Unquote 

 

By Order of the Board 

 

14 July 2020 

 
 
 


